
BID TABULATION 
2026 Roadway Maintenance Project

Bid Opening February 18, 2026

Item
No.

Description
Bid 

Quantity
Unit

HOLBROOK ASPHALT
MORGAN PAVEMENT

MANAGEMENT
MORGAN ASPHALT ASPHALT PRESERVATION

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

 BID SCHEDULE “A” - SLURRY SEAL TYPE II

A1
Furnish and Install Slurry Seal Type
II - Public Roads

185,000 SF $0.3700 $68,450.00 $0.2375 $43,937.50 NO BID $0.3000 $55,500.00

SUB TOTAL - BID SCHEDULE “A” $68,450.00 $43,937.50 $55,500.00

Comments

 BID SCHEDULE “B” - LIGHT WEIGHT AGGREGATE CHIP SEAL

B1
Furnish and Install Light Weight
Aggregate Chip Seal

2,400,000 $0.42 $1,008,000.00

NO BID NO BID NO BID

B2
Furnish and Install Railroad
Pavement Marking

8 $240.00 $1,920.00

B3
Furnish and Install Stop Ahead
Pavement Marking

2 $150.00 $300.00

B4
Furnish and Install Arrow  Pavement
Marking

48 $110.00 $5,280.00

B5
Furnish and Install School 
Pavement Marking

26 $110.00 $2,860.00

B6
Furnish and Install Bike Symbol
Pavement Marking

20 $115.00 $2,300.00

B7

Furnish and Install Bike Shared
Roadway Pavement Symbol (UDOT
Plan 3B) with Green  Background
Marking

20 $115.00 $2,300.00

B8
Furnish and Install Cross Walk
Pavement Marking

1,275 $8.00 $10,200.00

B9
Furnish and Install Stop Bar
Pavement Marking

720 $4.25 $3,060.00

B10
Furnish and Install 4-foot wide
Green Bike Lane

660 $14.50 $9,570.00

B11
Furnish and Install Dashed White
Line  Striping

1,320 $0.60 $792.00

B12
Furnish and Install White Line 
Striping

33,200 $0.40 $13,280.00

B13
Furnish and Install Dashed Yellow
Line Striping

725 $0.40 $290.00

B14
Furnish and Install Yellow Median
Line Striping

6,000 $0.40 $2,400.00
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BID TABULATION 
2026 Roadway Maintenance Project

Bid Opening February 18, 2026

Item
No.

Description
Bid 

Quantity
Unit

HOLBROOK ASPHALT
MORGAN PAVEMENT

MANAGEMENT
MORGAN ASPHALT ASPHALT PRESERVATION

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

 BID SCHEDULE “B” - LIGHT WEIGHT AGGREGATE CHIP SEAL (continued)

B15
Furnish and Install Double Yellow
Line Striping

19,600 $0.75 $14,700.00

NO BID NO BID NO BID
B16

Furnish and Install Parking Space
Pavement Marking and Striping
(Vine Street)

1 $545.00 $545.00

SUB TOTAL - BID SCHEDULE “B” $1,077,797.00

Comments 

 BID SCHEDULE “C” - ROTO-MILL AND ASPHALT OVERLAY

C1
Remove, Adjust and Reinstall 
Concrete Collars Around Water
Valves and Survey Monuments

20

NO BID

$1,380.30 $27,606.00 $1,000.00 $20,000.00

NO BID

C2
Remove, Adjust and Reinstall
Concrete Collars Around Manholes

13 $1,749.00 $22,737.00 $1,075.00 $13,975.00

C3
(Canyon Overlook Drive)  Roto-Mill
Edge of Existing Roadway (taper 2"

3,200 $6.07 $19,424.00 $3.15 $10,080.00

C4
(2000 North) Full Width Roto-Mill
Existing Roadway 1 ½"

25,200 $0.8250 $20,790.00 $0.51 $12,852.00

C5 Furnish and Install Level Course 100 $218.30 $21,830.00 $122.00 $12,200.00

C6
Furnish and Install 2 ½” PG 64-28
Asphalt

85,000 $2.0248 $172,108.00 $1.78 $151,300.00

SUB TOTAL - BID SCHEDULE “C” $284,495.00 $220,407.00

Comments 

Did not use Addendum
No. 1. However, the
Addendum did not modify
Bid Schedule C
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BID TABULATION 
2026 Roadway Maintenance Project

Bid Opening February 18, 2026

Item
No.

Description
Bid 

Quantity
Unit

STAKER & PARSONS
COMPANIES

BLACK FOREST PAVING M&M ASPHALT SERVICES
INTERMOUNTAIN 

SLURRY SEAL

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

 BID SCHEDULE “A” - SLURRY SEAL TYPE II

A1
Furnish and Install Slurry Seal Type
II - Public Roads

185,000 SF NO BID NO BID $0.1850 $34,225.00 NO BID

SUB TOTAL - BID SCHEDULE “A” $34,225.00

Comments

 BID SCHEDULE “B” - LIGHT WEIGHT AGGREGATE CHIP SEAL

B1
Furnish and Install Light Weight
Aggregate Chip Seal

2,400,000 $0.36 $864,000.00

NO BID NO BID

$0.42 $1,008,000.00

B2
Furnish and Install Railroad
Pavement Marking

8 $58.85 $470.80 $91.00 $728.00

B3
Furnish and Install Stop Ahead
Pavement Marking

2 $58.85 $117.70 $91.00 $182.00

B4
Furnish and Install Arrow  Pavement
Marking

48 $76.50 $3,672.00 $118.00 $5,664.00

B5
Furnish and Install School 
Pavement Marking

26 $76.50 $1,989.00 $118.00 $3,068.00

B6
Furnish and Install Bike Symbol
Pavement Marking

20 $76.50 $1,530.00 $118.00 $2,360.00

B7

Furnish and Install Bike Shared
Roadway Pavement Symbol (UDOT
Plan 3B) with Green  Background
Marking

20 $76.50 $1,530.00 $118.00 $2,360.00

B8
Furnish and Install Cross Walk
Pavement Marking

1,275 $1.65 $2,103.75 $2.55 $3,251.25

B9
Furnish and Install Stop Bar
Pavement Marking

720 $1.45 $1,044.00 $2.55 $1,836.00

B10
Furnish and Install 4-foot wide
Green Bike Lane

660 $1.20 $792.00 $1.82 $1,201.20

B11
Furnish and Install Dashed White
Line  Striping

1,320 $0.14 $184.80 $0.22 $290.40

B12
Furnish and Install White Line 
Striping

33,200 $0.29 $9,628.00 $0.46 $15,272.00

B13
Furnish and Install Dashed Yellow
Line Striping

725 $0.14 $101.50 $0.22 $159.50

B14
Furnish and Install Yellow Median
Line Striping

6,000 $0.29 $1,740.00 $0.45 $2,700.00
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BID TABULATION 
2026 Roadway Maintenance Project

Bid Opening February 18, 2026

Item
No.

Description
Bid 

Quantity
Unit

STAKER & PARSONS
COMPANIES

BLACK FOREST PAVING M&M ASPHALT SERVICES
INTERMOUNTAIN 

SLURRY SEAL

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

 BID SCHEDULE “B” - LIGHT WEIGHT AGGREGATE CHIP SEAL

B15
Furnish and Install Double Yellow
Line Striping

19,600 $0.47 $9,212.00

NO BID NO BID

$0.73 $14,308.00

B16
Furnish and Install Parking Space
Pavement Marking and Striping
(Vine Street)

1 $31.80 $31.80 $3,000.00 $3,000.00

SUB TOTAL - BID SCHEDULE “B” $898,147.35 $1,064,380.35

Comments 

 BID SCHEDULE “C” - ROTO-MILL AND ASPHALT OVERLAY

C1
Remove, Adjust and Reinstall 
Concrete Collars Around Water
Valves and Survey Monuments

20

NO BID

$750.00 $15,000.00

NO BID

$1,450.00 $29,000.00

C2
Remove, Adjust and Reinstall
Concrete Collars Around Manholes

13 $930.00 $12,090.00 $1,150.00 $14,950.00

C3
(Canyon Overlook Drive)  Roto-Mill
Edge of Existing Roadway (taper 2"

3,200 $3.00 $9,600.00 $3.15 $10,080.00

C4
(2000 North) Full Width Roto-Mill
Existing Roadway 1 ½"

25,200 $0.52 $13,104.00 $0.42 $10,584.00

C5 Furnish and Install Level Course 100 $118.00 $11,800.00 $133.00 $13,300.00

C6
Furnish and Install 2 ½” PG 64-28
Asphalt

85,000 $1.78 $151,300.00 $2.00 $170,000.00

SUB TOTAL - BID SCHEDULE “C” $212,894.00 $247,914.00

Comments 
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BID TABULATION 
2026 Roadway Maintenance Project

Bid Opening February 18, 2026

Item
No.

Description
Bid 

Quantity
Unit

GENEVA ROCK

Unit Price Total

 BID SCHEDULE “A” - SLURRY SEAL TYPE II

A1
Furnish and Install Slurry Seal Type
II - Public Roads

185,000 SF NO BID

SUB TOTAL - BID SCHEDULE “A”

Comments

 BID SCHEDULE “B” - LIGHT WEIGHT AGGREGATE CHIP SEAL

B1
Furnish and Install Light Weight
Aggregate Chip Seal

2,400,000 $0.47 $1,128,000.00

B2
Furnish and Install Railroad
Pavement Marking

8 $280.00 $2,240.00

B3
Furnish and Install Stop Ahead
Pavement Marking

2 $335.00 $670.00

B4
Furnish and Install Arrow  Pavement
Marking

48 $80.00 $3,840.00

B5
Furnish and Install School 
Pavement Marking

26 $112.00 $2,912.00

B6
Furnish and Install Bike Symbol
Pavement Marking

20 $70.00 $1,400.00

B7

Furnish and Install Bike Shared
Roadway Pavement Symbol (UDOT
Plan 3B) with Green  Background
Marking

20 $775.00 $15,500.00

B8
Furnish and Install Cross Walk
Pavement Marking

1,275 $15.50 $19,762.50

B9
Furnish and Install Stop Bar
Pavement Marking

720 $3.10 $2,232.00

B10
Furnish and Install 4-foot wide
Green Bike Lane

660 $31.00 $20,460.00

B11
Furnish and Install Dashed White
Line  Striping

1,320 $0.10 $132.00

B12
Furnish and Install White Line 
Striping

33,200 $0.35 $11,620.00

B13
Furnish and Install Dashed Yellow
Line Striping

725 $0.10 $72.50

B14
Furnish and Install Yellow Median
Line Striping

6,000 $0.90 $5,400.00
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BID TABULATION 
2026 Roadway Maintenance Project

Bid Opening February 18, 2026

Item
No.

Description
Bid 

Quantity
Unit

GENEVA ROCK

Unit Price Total

 BID SCHEDULE “B” - LIGHT WEIGHT AGGREGATE CHIP SEAL

B15
Furnish and Install Double Yellow
Line Striping

19,600 $0.70 $13,720.00

B16
Furnish and Install Parking Space
Pavement Marking and Striping
(Vine Street)

1 $6,200.00 $6,200.00

SUB TOTAL - BID SCHEDULE “B” $1,234,161.00

Comments 

 BID SCHEDULE “C” - ROTO-MILL AND ASPHALT OVERLAY

C1
Remove, Adjust and Reinstall 
Concrete Collars Around W
ater Valves and Survey Monuments

20 $6,000.00 $120,000.00

C2
Remove, Adjust and Reinstall
Concrete Collars Around Manholes

13 $5,600.00 $72,800.00

C3
(Canyon Overlook Drive)  Roto-Mill
Edge of Existing Roadway (taper 2"

3,200 $4.60 $14,720.00

C4
(2000 North) Full Width Roto-Mill
Existing Roadway 1 ½"

25,200 $1.35 $34,020.00

C5 Furnish and Install Level Course 100 $200.85 $20,085.00

C6
Furnish and Install 2 ½” PG 64-28
Asphalt

85,000 $2.71 $230,350.00

SUB TOTAL - BID SCHEDULE “C” $491,975.00

Comments 

Page 6 of  6


